
Chapter 2181
Everyone was dumbfounded at the sight of Philip slapping Levi.

Was the eldest young master of the main family so arrogant? He even dared to hit Levi!

He really showed no respect to the eldest young master of the branch family at all!

Levi’s cheeks flushed red. The clear slap mark was so eye-catching and looked like a
stamp of humiliation!

He glared coldly at Philip and roared, “Philip, how dare you hit me?! This is my
residence!”

However, Philip just smiled calmly as he looked at the hysterical Levi and said, “So what
if this is your residence? If you dare to yell at me again, believe it or not, I’ll hit you
again.”

Levi was frightened by those words. He took several steps back and said with a frown,
“Philip, don’t be too cocky. Even if you’re the eldest young master of the main family,
you’ll suffer the consequence if you beat the eldest young master of the branch family in
our territory.”

After that, he waved his hand and said, “Men, come here and surround them! Today, I
want to personally teach him a lesson on what it means to respect his elders!”

That was right, Levi was two years older than Philip. He was Philip’s elder.

Thud!

Instantly, in a yard of thousands of square feet, teams of guards wearing black combat
uniforms surrounded them from all directions! They were all armed with guns, which
were aimed at Philip and the dozen members of Griffin Army behind him.

The atmosphere was extremely tense.

When Levi saw that his guards had surrounded Philip and his men, he finally dared to
step forward with his hands behind his back. He narrowed his eyes, raised his chin
arrogantly as he looked at Philip, and said coldly, “Do you want to know what I have to
say? Well, let’s see how you’re going to demand an explanation!”



After saying that, Levi looked at Philip with a sneer.

Philip swept a glance across the branch family’s guards who were pointing their guns at
him. With a faint chill in the corner of his eyes, he roared. “Outrageous! How dare you
point your guns at me? Do you still want to live?!”

This roar was deafening! The group of the branch family’s guards looked at each other..

They were not stupid. The person in front of them was the eldest young master of the
main family. Pointing their guns at Philip was an act of self-destruction.

However, this was the branch family, and their responsibility was to protect the branch
family. Thus, after some hesitation, they still aimed their guns at Philip.

At this scene, Levi laughed and said, How about it, Philip? Do you still want to use your
prestige as the young master of the main family to scare my branch family’s guards?
What a fool’s dream! This is the branch family and they’re the guards of the branch
family. Of course, they’ll only obey the orders of the branch family! Now, I order you to
kneel and apologize for the disrespect you just showed me!”

Levi smirked as he watched all of this, his face full of pride.

The rich kids standing on the side also stood up at this moment and began to ridicule
Philip.

It seemed that Sunny’s death just now was just an accident to them.

“Oh, I wondered how powerful he was, but it turns out he’s just a rash and impulsive
young master. Sunny was too pitiful to have become collateral damage. It’s all good
now. Young Master Levi will definitely take revenge for him!”

“It seems that the young master of the Clarke family is no big deal, after all. The rumors
from the outside world are all false and just meant to paint a pretty picture.”

A group of people chattered incessantly.

When these words reached Philip’s ears, he was very unhappy.

His cold eyes swept over the scene again. Wherever his gaze passed, those rich kids
who spoke with irony on their faces fell silent once more.
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It was too scary! How could this guy’s gaze look so terrifying?

At this moment, with everyone watching, Philip cocked an eyebrow and looked at Levi
coldly. He asked, “Are you really not going to explain what happened last night?”

Levi chuckled and said, “Last night? What happened last night? I don’t know what
you’re talking about.”

Philip’s eyes went cold as he clenched his fists.

Levi added, “Oh, yes, now I remember. Do you mean that thing about your wife taking
your child to see a doctor? Hehe, that’s right, I arranged it. No doctor in the Clarke
family will take them in for a medical check-up. A slut and a bastard from the outside
world have no right to enjoy the superior medical resources of the Clarke family What,
has your daughter died from her illness already? It can’t be that soon, right?”

After saying that, Levi sneered unkindly.

Hearing this, the pent-up anger in Philip exploded at this moment! Some people kept
testing the waters and tempting death!

In that case, they could not blame Philip for being ruthless.

Stomp!

In everyone’s eyes, Philip moved. He stepped forward, passed through the Griffin Army,
faced the cold muzzles of the branch family’s guards, and walked toward Levi!

Levi frowned as he had a very bad premonition and said sullenly, “Philip, stop right
there! If you dare take another step forward, I’ll get them to fire!”

However, Philip did not seem to hear Levi and continued to stride forward.

Levi was furious. Seeing Philip getting closer, he roared. “What are you waiting for?
Fire!”

The branch family’s guards immediately pulled the safety!



Swish!

However, before the branch family’s guards who made a move knew what was going
on, a light whistle rang in the ears. Then, a long silver arrow pierced through their
bulletproof vests before their heads went crooked and they fell in a pool of blood on the
floor!

This happened in a split second! The Griffin Army behind Philip had fired their arrows!

Levi was shocked and roared. “Everyone, fire! Shoot them! Kill them all! If something
goes wrong, I’ll be responsible!”

However, it was too late! Philip had already walked up to Levi. His eyes were like the
demon lord from hell as he stared at Levi condescendingly and said solemnly, “You’re
seeking death!”

After saying that, Philip reached out and fiercely strangled Levi’s neck, lifting him!

Levi’s face turned red as he clutched at Philip’s arms and beat him non-stop. “You… Let
go of me… Let go.”

Levi felt very uncomfortable and rolled back. He had difficulty breathing his eyes and
kept kicking his legs!

Those rich kids all around panicked at this scene!

Thump!

Philip threw Levi into the pool that wass dyed red just now!

Levi fell into the pool, choked on a few mouthfuls of water, and struggled to get his head
out of the water.

However, before he could catch his breath, a big unfeeling hand grabbed his head and
pressed him down again.

Splash!

Levi struggled desperately and flapped his arms constantly, splashing water all over.



Philip asked coldly, “Do you know your mistake now?”
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Splash!

Philip pulled Levi’s head up. Levi was choking on a lot of water at the moment.

Spitting out the water, he shouted fiercely, “I don’t admit it! How dare you do this to me?!
I’ll ask my fathers”

Splash!

Before Levi could finish his sentence, Philip once again pressed his head into the water
!

This went on repeatedly.

Finally, Philip let go.

Levi flailed a couple of times before floating in the pool.

Seeing this scene, those rich young masters and young ladies who were hiding in
silence trembled and dared not speak!

This was too horrible !

He actually drowned Levi?

Philip got up and indifferently looked at Levi’s body floating in the pool. He turned and
left with the Griffin Army.

After they left, the guards of the branch family jumped into the pool to fish Levi out.
Then, medical staff appeared and quickly gave Levi CPR and artificial respiration.

After ten minutes of rescue, Levi inhaled sharply. His eyes widened and he vomited a
few mouthfuls of water before slumping weakly on the ground.

He truly just had a near-death experience. He sat up with red eyes and roared angrily,
“Philip Clarke, I won’t let you off!”



The group of rich kids also gathered around and asked about him in concern.

Levi pushed them away coldly and staggered as he left the yard with the help of his
servants.

Philip received a call from George Thomas not long after he left the branch family.

“Young Master, Miss Chloe of the Sommerset family has arrived at Arcadia Island. Do
you want to meet her?” George asked cautiously.

Philip frowned and asked, “Why is she here?”

It had been a long time since he had heard from Chloe, so he was a little surprised.

George stammered, “Uh, Miss Chloe is your fiancee in name, after all. Moreover, she
has a marriage contract with you.”

Speaking of this, Philip felt himself getting a headache.

He had brought Wynn back to Arcadia Island but he had not perfectly resolved this
matter with Chloe yet.

“Okay, I get it. Where is she?” Philip asked.

George said, “Max Bar.”

“Okay.” Philip ended the call and stuck his hands in his trouser pockets, looking a little
helpless.

What was this woman doing in Arcadia Island at this time?

District 9, Max Bar.

Although it was daytime outside, the bar was full  full of music and dance. It was very
lively.

Philip was slightly unhappy as he walked into this place where young people looked to
release their overactive hormones.



Why did Chloe come to this place alone? What would happen if she was taken
advantage of?

After searching for a long time, he finally found Chloe in a white short skirt sitting at the
bar counter. She was holding a glass of wine in her hand and bowing her head
drunkenly.

There were also two tattooed delinquent youths next to her, leaning against Chloe’s
body. They obviously had bad intentions.

At this time, Chloe was so drunk that her mind was a little fuzzy. The two delinquent
youths with tattoos and permed hair came to chat with Chloe because of her beauty at
first, but when they saw no one around Chloe and that she seemed drunk, malicious
thoughts welled in their minds.

One of the young men put his hand on Chloe’s fair shoulder and asked, “Hey pretty, why
are you drinking by yourself? Do you want my company?”
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Chloe’s eyes were blurry at this time, and she could not hear clearly.

Hearing someone talking to her at this time, Chloe asked without raising her head,
“Philip, are you here to pick me up?”

The two youths glanced at each other and smirked lecherously. This little hussy was
actually calling out a man’s name . Was she troubled by love?

“Oh, it’s me! I’m here to pick you up! Come home with me, hehe.” The other guy said
with a wicked smile before he reached out for Chloe’s waist.

Unexpectedly, Chloe acted as if she was electrocuted. She shook off the hands of the
two, saying angrily and aggrievedly, “I don’t want to go home with you! You’re already
married and have kids. You have long forgotten our initial promise. I hate you!”

While saying that, Chloe started crying. The two delinquent youths were stunned and
exchanged a glance.

One of the youths asked for a glass of wine at the bar.



Seeing that no one was paying attention, he quietly put something in and swayed the
glass to dissolve it into the wine.

“Oh, don’t be angry! It’s all my fault. I’ll make it up to you. Here, let me buy you a drink!”

With that said, the young man handed the glass of wine to Chloe. As long as she drank
the wine, she would be at the mercy of these two villains today!

The two of them looked at Chloe’s peach-like face, slender collarbone, and soft body.

They felt hot all over when they thought about it and could hardly resist the desire in
their hearts.

As they persuaded Chloe to drink, they rubbed against her with malicious intent.

Philip saw this scene when he walked in to look for Chloe!

Chloe was in a daze at this time and thought that the one who handed her the wine was
Philip. In confusion, she took the glass and was about to drink it.

A gray shadow flashed in the crowd. Philip rushed over with lightning speed, grabbed
the glass of wine in her hand, and placed it on the table with a bang.

Chloe huffed and stammered unhappily, “Meanie, you said you bought me a drink but
you won’t let me drink it. You’re hateful.”

Philip felt an ache in his heart. He glared at the two delinquent youths fiercely, his
expression shrouded with murderous intent. “You two, what did you put in the wine you
just gave her?” Philip asked, his voice cold and piercing.

The two youths did not expect that someone would appear and disrupt their plans. They
were slightly taken aback before bursting into anger!

One of them rolled his eyes, looked at Philip with his nose high in the air, and grabbed
Philip by the collar. “Boy, who are you? What’s it to you? Are you trying to meddle in our
business? Are you tired of living?”

Philip looked down at the hand on his collar and sneered grimly. “Tired of living? Who?
Philip



grabbed the guy’s wrist.”

The young man was stunned. “How dare you fight back?! You-“

Before he finished speaking, Philip clasped his five steel-like fingers violently!

Crack!

The youth was still being pretentious when he felt a sharp pain from his wrist! “You…
Ah! It hurts! Let go of me, you brat!”

Let go? Philip chuckled, flipped his wrist, and twisted the youth’s wrist.

The youth instantly could not take it and released his grip on Philip’s collar. Then, he
was forced to turn around as Philip wrenched his wrist behind him.

He was pressed to the bar by Philip in an arrest position.

“Ouch, it hurts! Let go of me right now, do you hear?”

Before he finished his sentence, Philip slapped him in the mouth.
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Philip had controlled his strength when he slapped the youth but the latter still could not
take it.

With just one hit, the youth felt his teeth coming loose as blood gushed in his mouth!

“Are there any adults in your family? Didn’t they teach you how to speak? I’m telling
you, keep your mouth clean. If you still speak like this, I’ll continue to slap you! Hear
that?” Philip coldly reprimanded, the tone of his voice very strong and not to be
questioned! “

“I… understand.”

Such a delinquent youth was not a member of the streets but an idle member of society
who had dropped out of school a long time ago. He was a typical bully who only picked
on the weak.

The youth was in pain and fear after being beaten by Philip, so he immediately gave in.



When the other youth on the side saw that Phinp was so powerful, he was so frightened
that he dared not breathe aloud.

“Did you rub against her just now?” Philip asked with a glare.

“I just bumped into her accidentally. I didn’t rub against her. Him, it’s him! That guy put
his arm around the girl’s shoulders just now.”

The youth who was tackled by Philip quickly sold his buddy out in an instant.

The other youth was startled and cursed his friend inwardly for being unscrupulous!
Then, he turned to run.

However, how could he escape in front of Philip? When he was about to move, Philip
pressed on the first guy with his right hand, and with lightning speed, his left hand
quickly caught the kid who was about to run.

“Run? Where do you want to run to after doing something so wicked? Tell me which
hand you used to touch her shoulder.” Philip said coldly with a murderous look in his
eyes.

The young man he caught was so frightened that he almost pissed his pants! He
shuddered all over and could not say a word.

“You’re not telling me? I’ll get rid of both your hands, then,” Philip said blandly and
moved swiftly like the wind!

Immediately after that, two crunching sounds could be heard!

The young man who put his arm around Chloe’s shoulders earlier got both his arms
broken by Philip in an instant!

Argh!

A miserable scream resounded throughout the bar.

The security guards had long heard the commotion and stood around wanting to stop
them, but due to Philip’s intensity and aggressiveness, no one dared to make the first
move.



At this moment, Chloe sobered up slightly by the howl of the young man who had put
his arm around her shoulders. She turned around and rubbed her eyes.

She looked at Philip and the two youths, then she asked in a very cute daze, “Huh?
Why are there two Philips…? No, there are three?”

Philip sighed slightly, feeling a little distressed for Chloe.

At this time, Chloe finally recognized Philip. She got up from her seat and stumbled to
Philip’s side.

Grabbing the corner of Philip’s clothes, she said coquettishly like a child, “Philip, what
took you so long? I want to drink. Where did you put my wine?”

Philip laughed wryly as his right hand pressed the other youth and his left hand gently
pulled Chloe’s small hand.

“That glass of wine is no good. Let’s give it to someone else.”

As he said that, Philip turned his head and stared at the delinquent young man he was
pressing on the table with the gaze of a wild beast.

The man was startled by Philip’s eyes and said quickly, “Uh, dude, you’ve already
beaten me. Just let me go!”

Philip smiled grimly and said, “I can let you go but you still have something to do.”

With that said, Philip took the drugged glass of wine and slammed it heavily in front of
the youth’s face.

“You ordered this wine, so you drink it!”

“Huh? D-Drink this?” The delinquent youth who was pinned to the table by Philip stared
fixedly at the glass of liquid, his expression full of hesitation.

“This… Sir, I don’t drink.”

The delinquent refused while shrinking his head back desperately, but he was held
down by Philip.



How could he break free? Philip sneered. “What bullshit are you talking about? Why
come to a bar if you don’t drink? Are you here to drink milk instead of alcohol? Hurry up
and drink this! Quick!”

The delinquent looked panicked and could not utter a full sentence.
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“You don’t want to drink it? Could there be something in the wine?” Philip said coldly as
his eyes tensed with murderous intent!

“This…”

Faced with Philip’s questions, the delinquent’s voice grew smaller and smaller as sweat
dripped from his forehead. His pupils were shifting erratically, and his heart was full of
fear.

“I’ll ask you again. Will you drink it?” Philip said lightly.

Although his voice was not loud, his words were full of murderous intent. One could not
help but shudder upon hearing it.

The delinquent did not speak.

Smack!

Philip slapped him vehemently.

This time, it was with more force than the previous one.

“Ow!” The delinquent yelled and spat out a few teeth.

Blood gushed from his mouth, and his body trembled all over with pain.

Philip said, “This is the second time. If I have to ask you for the third time, you’ll end up
worse than the person on the ground right now!”

The delinquent’s ears buzzed! He looked at his companion who had fainted on the
ground, and his face could not help shaking violently. He had clearly seen the ferocity



and speed of Philip’s attack just now. The person on the ground had just put his arm on
the woman’s shoulders and his arms were broken.

The delinquent felt the pain just thinking of the image and the sound of bones cracking
just now.

Worse than this?

What son of torture would that be? With that thought, the delinquent quickly shouted, “I’ll
drink! Don’t hit me anymore! I’m the only son in my family. You mustn’t harm me!”

Having said that, the delinquent hurriedly reached out to grab the glass of wine that he
had drugged. He took the glass tremblingly and without thinking, he raised his head and
gulped the contents.

Very soon after drinking, he seemed to be drunk as he swayed and slumped on the bar
counter.

Philip sighed. He looked at Chloe, who was behind him. If he had arrived a moment
later, what would have happened to her if she drank the wine and fainted in the arms of
these two guys?

It was scary just thinking about it!

Did she come to the bar without an entourage?

At this time, he could not help but feel angry. He kicked the delinquent whose arms
were broken on the floor!

Bang!

With a muffled sound, the delinquent’s body rolled out like a bowling ball, hitting many
tables and chairs along the way.

He screamed in pain and flailed around before his eyes rolled back. He fainted again.

All eyes in the bar were focused on Philip at this time. Everyone was dumbfounded.

This kid was so violent! Who was he?



Was he the young lady’s boyfriend?

At this time, several women in the bar who came to have fun could not help talking
about it.

“Wow! Who is this guy? He’s so manly! I like him so much!”

“Look, not only is he manly, but he’s also quite handsome.”

“Ah, it’s a pity he already has a girlfriend or I’d definitely be with him! This kind of man is
fantastic! He’ll make you feel super safe!”

The women chattered incessantly.

At this time, Chloe was still in a daze and pulling on Philip’s clothes, acting like a child.
“Philip, why don’t you bring me a drink? I want to drink! Do you dote on me or not?”

Philip was helpless. After all, they were previously in love.

He said softly, “Chloe, we’ve drunk a lot today. We can’t drink anymore. Your body won’t
be able to take it. Let me send you back.”
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Chloe swayed around for a while before saying, “Okay, but I can’t walk..”

Philip sighed. “Okay, I get it. Why are you acting like a child after a few drinks? Should I
carry you on my back?”

“Uh, no!” Chloe acted like a child and stretched her arms toward Philip. “I want a hug!”

“A hug?!” Philip was taken aback, and his eyes were widened .

How could he? This would be too intimate, right?

At this time, the onlookers got more excited. Many girls covered their faces and
cheered. “Wow, so romantic!”

“Hug her! Hurry up!”

“Hug her for a million years!”



Philip was extremely embarrassed. With his face slightly twitching, he explained to the
onlookers, “Don’t misunderstand. She’s just a friend!”

While Philip was explaining to the onlookers, he suddenly felt a warm and soft touch
from behind his body at this time.

Chloe embraced Philip from behind!

Pfft!

Philip almost choked. “C-Chloe?”

Philip exclaimed and slowly turned back to look at Chloe.

At this moment, Chloe’s face was flushed red. She opened her intoxicated and beautiful
eyes slightly, looking at him subtly.

Chloe felt a little hot due to the alcohol, and because of the close contact, Philip clearly
felt her body temperature.

Gulp.

Philip swallowed. Drink less and one would not get drunk. Do not touch and one would
not get tempted!

At this time, a drunk and beautiful woman with charming eyes and an enchanting body
had taken the initiative to hug Philip. To say that he was not tempted would be a
complete lie!

Philip’s heart was beating so fast that it almost jumped out of his mouth. If he did not do
something, he was afraid something might happen!

With that thought in mind, Philip could no longer refuse. Amid everyone’s cheers, he
picked up Chloe princess-style and they got into a car.

He drove quickly to a nearby hotel. At the hotel, Chloe threw up all over the floor, so
Philip took care of her for a while.



Since Chloe threw up, most of the alcohol in her stomach was out. Hence, her
consciousness began to clear up and her mind was more aware,

Philip helped her to the bathroom and asked her to quickly take a shower. They would
talk tomorrow.

Chloe was sober at this time. She nodded, entered the bathroom, and closed the door.

Philip collapsed on the sofa and let out a long sigh!

As a result, as soon as Philip sat down, he heard Chloe talking in the bathroom.

“Philip, can you come in and help me? I can’t get my clothes undone.”

“W-What?” Philip shuddered with excitement.

“C-Can’t undress?” Philip stammered.

What should he do? He had good intentions, but if this continued and Wynn found out
about it, he was afraid that she would misunderstand.

Faced with Philip’s question, Chloe also blushed in the bathroom. She heard the
awkwardness in Philip’s voice.

At this point, she had thrown up most of the alcohol in her stomach and her mind was
clear.

However, drinking a lot of alcohol had rendered her body soft and weak.

When Chloe went out today, she wore a strapless dress with a zipper at the back. If she
wanted to undress for a shower, she had to reach out and unzip the zipper at the back.
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Chloe’s limbs were weak. The zipper was pulled halfway down and got stuck when her
hand started trembling. The zipper could neither go up nor down now. She had no
choice but to ask Philip for help. She was also very shy about it!

Now that she was sober, she remembered being at the bar and acting like a child with
Philip in front of so many people. She even took the initiative to hug him. Her pretty face
was flushed so red it was almost purple!



After all, she had not been so close to a man for a long time. Moreover, it was the man
she loved so much. However, he was already married.

“D-Don’t overthink it! The zipper is stuck and I really can’t pull it down!”

Chloe’s voice was aggrieved and anxious. She was about to cry.

“Oh!”

Philip was also taken aback. After listening to Chloe’s explanation, he hurriedly agreed
and stumbled to the bathroom.

At the bathroom door, Philip coughed and said, “Um, I’m here. You can open the door.

After a long time, the door slowly opened and revealed a gap. Chloe was also in a
dilemma whether she should open the door for Philip.

Chloe’s cute little head stuck out from inside, and her pretty face was flushed red from
embarrassment. It seemed as if smoke was about to rise from her head.

“P-Please come in,” Chloe said as she lowered her head and opened the door
completely.

Philip walked in and Chloe hurriedly closed the door, her breathing becoming rapid.

Someone not in the know might think that they were doing something that could not be
seen by others!

“What are you doing?” Philip was taken aback and said.

Chloe’s behavior and expression had caused Philip to misunderstand.

Chloe also seemed to realize this, and the flush on her face became more vivid!

“You mustn’t misunderstand! I’m sweating all over and felt cold with the door open!
Don’t think too much! I’ll kick you to death if you think like that again! I’ll tell your wife!”

“Uh, no!”



Philip quickly responded and lowered his head in shame.

At this moment, Chloe blushed and stepped in front of Philip. She turned around slightly,
pointed to her back with difficulty, and said, “It’s that one. Just help me pull it down and
go out immediately! Don’t delay and don’t let your eyes stray!”

Philip did not speak but just nodded heavily.

Seeing this, Chloe showed her back to Philip.

Philip raised his head slightly and reached out out for the zipper on Chloe’s back.

At this time, the zipper was already partly pulled down by her. Due to her weak arms,
the zipper was stuck in one spot. The part of her flesh that was exposed was very
delicate like jelly, and the shape of her two shoulder blades was clearly visible.

From the back, Chloe’s long hair was soft and black. Her waist was very slender as if it
had been painted by a well-known artist. Her figure was so beautiful. Just the sight of
her back alone could leave a man with infinite fantasies. She was truly a femme fatale!

Philip looked at her back and could not help being stunned. Sensing no movement from
Philip after a while, Chloe could not help being puzzled and turned slightly to look at
Philip.

Unexpectedly, when she turned her head, she found that Philip was watching her in a
daze. She could not help feeling ashamed!

She quickly pulled her clothes up and glared at Philip with anger. She was feeling
aggrieved as well. Tears welled in her eyes.

“Stop looking! Close your eyes!”

Philip froze as Chloe’s anger brought him back to reality.

“Okay, I won’t look! I’ll close my eyes!”

This time, Philip forced himself to stop thinking about all that nonsense and reached out
to fumble for the zipper.

In a panic, he abruptly pulled it down!



As a result, Philip was too anxious and ripped Chloe’s clothes apart!

Chloe was stunned for a moment before she started to scream.

Philip was also shocked and ran out of the bathroom while apologizing.
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Philip ran out of the hotel in a hurry. Feeling the sunshine, he took a deep breath. He
looked back at the upper floors of the hotel while feeling helpless and remorseful.

Chloe was still a romantic history he could not get rid of. Something had almost
happened in the suite just now. When did this woman become so soft? Was this what
she meant by changing herself and letting him get to know her again?

Philip shook his head and drove back to Clarke Manor. That was because he had to
take Wynn and Mila to visit his mother’s mausoleum in the afternoon.

In a room on the hotel’s upper floors behind a large French window, Chloe was wearing
a bathrobe. With her arms across her chest, her eyes were cold and complicated as she
looked at Philip walking to his car.

At this moment, any trace of drunkenness had disappeared from her face. Behind her, a
guard in a black suit said respectfully, “Miss, those two punks have already been taken
care of. No one noticed anything.”

Chloe nodded and watched as Philip left.

“Miss, forgive me for saying something I shouldn’t. You’re the young lady of the
Sommerset family and Mr. Clarke is already married. You shouldn’t be like this.”

“Shut up! You’re in no position to mind my business!” Chloe chided. She turned around,
looked at the guard behind her, and said coldly, “This matter is not allowed to be
disclosed. Otherwise, I’ll hold you responsible!”

“Yes!” The guard responded and turned helplessly to leave the suite.

Cold intent faintly appeared on Chloe’s pretty face as she said softly, “Philip, I said I
won’t give up on you! No matter the means and tactics, I’ll make you fall in love with me
again!”



After saying that, Chloe turned to look downstairs againbut Philip’s car was already far
away. Everything that happened today was arranged by Chloe in advance.

The farce in the bar and the two punks were also arranged by Chloe. Even the shy and
innocent appearance she displayed in the hotel suite just now was a performance.

For Philip’s sake, she could change herself. However, Philip did not seem to fall for this.

Philip returned to his residence and saw that Wynn was ready.

“Phil, you’re back. Where have you been? You’re sweating all over.”

Wynn walked over, straightened Philip’s clothes, and wiped the sweat from his
forehead.

However, at that moment, Wymn’s sensitive nose caught a whiff of a woman’s perfume
on Philip. She looked slightly stunned and hesitated.

Philip was startled and asked, “What’s wrong?”

Wynn forced a smile and said, “It’s nothing. By the way, when are we going over in the
afternoon?” Wynn did a good job of concealing the change in her inner emotions.

Did Philip go out on a date with another woman? Did he cheat on her? Wynn’s hean
was in a mess, and her expression was a little ugly, but she squeezed out a smile.

Philip did not notice the change in Wynn’s mood and said, “Yeah, I’ll take you there in a
while.”

At this time, Mila ran down from the playroom upstairs and jumped into Philip’s arms.
Her braids bounced up , making her look very cute.

Philip picked up Mila, scratched her little nose happily, and asked, “Have you been
obediently listening to Mom?”

Mila wiggled her fingers and said with a smile, “Yes, I’m very obedient.”

Philip smiled and then asked, “So, has the doctor at home gotten the results?”



Wynn shook her head and said, “No, Dr. Garfield Gates isn‘t around. He’s said to be out
visiting friends. Several other doctors drew Mila’s blood for lab tests.”

Philip frowned slightly, nodded, and said, “I see.”

It should not be this slow. Could it be that Mila really had some hidden illness? Was it
the same as Wynn?

Chapter 2190
Philip was a little flustered. After holding Mila for a while, they left for his mother’s
mausoleum. Escorted by the guards, Philip brought Wynn and Mila onto the small
cruise ship.

As Nelson was born prematurely, it was not convenient for him to come out, so they did
not bring him along.

On the island, Buck Jolly had been waiting for a long time. When he saw Wynn and Mila
by Philip’s side, he grinned and greeted with a respectful smile, “Young Madam, Young
Miss.”

Wynn smiled gently and greeted, “Hello, Mr. Jolly.”

During their journey here, Philip had already introduced Buck and some of the island
guards to Wynn.

Buck was stunned for a moment before his eyes reddened a little.

This young madam was so easy-going, unlike some wives of the other young masters
of the Clarke family who were arrogant and domineering. To guards like them, those
wives always bad- mouthed them and ordered them around.

“Young Madam, you’re too polite. Just call me Buck,” Buck said.

Wynn  said, “You’ve been guarding my mother-in-law’s mausoleum for a long time. It’s a
tough job. This is the least I can do.”

Hearing this, Buck’s eyes got redder, and the other guards also had red eyes. Very few
people would care about them like this.



Apart from Philip and Wynn, guards like them were just tools in the eyes of others. Their
lives were not worth mentioning, so no one would care about their tough jobs.

At that moment, Buck and his buddies swore to protect Philip and Wynn to their deaths.

Soon, the group arrived at the mausoleum. Philip took Wynn up to pay respects. Then,
Wynn asked Philip to go first, saying that she had something to down say to her
mother-in-law.

Philip had no choice but to walk down and meet up with Buck in the small square below.

“Young Master, I’ve made arrangements for the things you told me to. You can mobilize
the troop at any time.” Buck stood next to Philip at this moment as a cold chill flashed
across his eyes.

Philip nodded, looked up at the sky, felt the salty sea breeze blowing on his face, and
said, “Tomorrow is the ancestor commemoration day. Wait a little longer. When the time
comes, you may take charge of them. Wait for my orders.”

Buck nodded and replied, “Okay, I understand.”

Philip stood for a while and watched as Wynn walked down from above while holding
Mila’s hand.

“What did you talk about?” Philip asked as he went over and tenderly put a trench coat
on Wynn.

Wynn hooked her hair behind her ears and said, “Nothing. Let’s go back.”

“Okay.” Philip nodded, bade farewell to Buck, and returned to Arcadia Island.

As soon as Philip and Wynn arrived on the island, they saw a lot of heavily armed
guards standing on the small square in front of Philip’s residence!

At this moment, Levi blocked the entrance with a team of guards.

With gloomy eyes, he looked at Philip and Wynn and sneered, “Philip, you’re finally
back. I’ve been waiting for you!”



Philip’s face darkened as he pulled Wynn behind him. He looked around and asked
grimly, “What are you doing here?”

Levi laughed and said, “Do you have the cheek to ask me this question? You ruined my
party and almost killed me. I’m here to seek revenge!”


